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Observation of your reactions provides you a sense
of control giving you some predictability of your
responses instead of giving you the feeling that you
are a victim of external forces that dominate you. Self-
monitoring helps you identify specific triggers  that
make panic attacks likely to occur. Monitoring allows
you to evaluate your progress as you make changes
in your behavior.

Panic attacks should be monitored by using a portable
Panic Attack Record. It should be used every time
you have a panic attack or a sudden rush of fear, and
it should be completed immediately after the event
rather than at the end of the day. Information you
should complete includes: time of onset, duration of
the attack, and with whom it occurred. A brief
description of the stressful event, whether the fear was
expected or unexpected, and the maximum level of
fear experienced should be noted on the record.

The first symptom that occurred should be underlined,
and all other symptoms that have at least been mildly
present should be marked.

Besides panic attacks, it is important to record general
levels of anxiety and other moods. Anticipatory
anxiety, or anxiety about the recurrence of panic is
probably the most important feature to observe about
panic attacks. Levels of anxiety and depression should
be recorded on the Daily Mood Record at the end of
each day. These feelings are estimated using a 0 –8
point scales where 0 is lowest and eight is as high as
you have ever experienced.


